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Seminar paper from the year 2009 in the subject Cultural Studies - Empiric Cultural Studies, grade: 1, -
(Hamline University - International Journalism), course: Senior Research Seminar, language: English,
abstract: Do Hamline students get an education to become global citizens? According to its mission
statement in the Hamline Plan, the College of Liberal Arts at Hamline University (Saint Paul, MN) is
dedicated to preparing its students to "compassionate citizens of the world by helping them maximize their
intellectual, creative, and leadership potential". The main research question of this paper investigates if the
school realizes its goal by analyzing the second language skills Hamline students can gain or are supposed to
gain to become a global citizen.
Globalization and the "shrinking of the world" lead to the necessity to speak foreign languages since the
peoples come closer. Even with the global dominance of English, a global citizen needs to be prepared to
face language barriers gaining more knowledge than just knowing the English language. Second language is
considered as a window for citizens to learn about the outside world and is hence a window to see different
cultures.
This micro-level study explores the exposure of students in private liberal arts colleges in the Midwest in the
U.S. utilizing Hamline University as an example. The students of the Certificate in International Journalism
and Global Studies majors are the only students required to study abroad to strengthen their second language
skills. However, they are a small group of students at Hamline University which probably achieve the goal to
become "a citizen of the world" because they acquire the skills to communicate in a foreign culture and make
connections in the world. Based on surveys about the language skills of Hamline CLA students at Hamline
University combined with the content of the mission, I argue that Hamline University does not prepare
adequately its students to become global citizens because they do not require them to advance their language
skills, which ultimately leads to a lack of ability to communicate in the world.
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From reader reviews:

Roger Dupre:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question mainly
because just their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need that Becoming a global citizen without foreign
language education?: A micro-level study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in
comparison to the Hamline Plan to read.

Benedict Wilkerson:

This Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-level study about the foreign
language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan book is absolutely not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is actually
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you read a lot of
information you will get. This Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-level
study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan without
we understand teach the one who looking at it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't always
be worry Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-level study about the
foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan can bring when you are
and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your
lovely laptop even phone. This Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-
level study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan
having good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Fannie Vincent:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys that aren't like that. This Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-
level study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan
book is readable simply by you who hate those straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange
for enjoyable reading experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you.
The writer connected with Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-level
study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan content
conveys prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the
information but it just different such as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Becoming a global citizen
without foreign language education?: A micro-level study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA
students in comparison to the Hamline Plan is not loveable to be your top record reading book?



Rodolfo Born:

Typically the book Becoming a global citizen without foreign language education?: A micro-level study
about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA students in comparison to the Hamline Plan will bring
someone to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the
event you try to find new book to see, this book very appropriate to you. The book Becoming a global citizen
without foreign language education?: A micro-level study about the foreign language skills of Hamline CLA
students in comparison to the Hamline Plan is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book
through the official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.
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