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The pilot watches the instrument panel and prepares for touchdown—a routine landing until a burst of birds,
a coyote, or a herd of deer crosses the runway! Every year, pilots experience this tension and many aircraft
come into direct contact with birds and other wildlife, resulting in more than one billion dollars in damage
annually. The United States Federal Aviation Administration has recorded a rise in these incidents over the
past decade due to the combined effects of more reporting, rebounding wildlife populations, and an increased
number of flights. Wildlife in Airport Environments tackles the issue of what to do about encounters with
wildlife in and around airports—from rural, small-craft airparks to major international hubs.

Whether the problem is birds or bats in the flight path or a moose on the runway, the authors provide a
thorough overview of the science behind wildlife management at airports. This well-written, carefully
documented volume presents a clear synthesis for researchers, wildlife managers, and airport professionals.
The book belongs in the hands of all those charged with minimizing the risks that wildlife pose to air travel.

Wildlife in Airport Environments is the first book in the series Wildlife Management and Conservation and is
published in association with The Wildlife Society.
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From reader reviews:

Martin Sanchez:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are reading
whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. Think about the person who don't like studying a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise. Well,
probably you will require this Wildlife in Airport Environments (Wildlife Management and Conservation).

Allen Brown:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you do?
All people has many questions above. They must answer that question since just their can do this. It said that
about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on guardería until
university need this particular Wildlife in Airport Environments (Wildlife Management and Conservation) to
read.

Joyce Volz:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but additionally novel and Wildlife in Airport Environments (Wildlife
Management and Conservation) or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you know
how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or
even students especially. Those guides are helping them to include their knowledge. In various other case,
beside science reserve, any other book likes Wildlife in Airport Environments (Wildlife Management and
Conservation) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Craig Brown:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just trying to find the Wildlife in Airport Environments (Wildlife Management and
Conservation) when you needed it?
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