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Location-based Services (LBSs) are mobile services for providing information that has been created,
compiled, selected or filtered under consideration of the users’ current locations or those of other persons or
mobile devices. Typical examples are restaurant finders, buddy trackers, navigation services or applications
in the areas of mobile marketing and mobile gaming. The attractiveness of LBSs is due to the fact that users
are not required to enter location information manually but are automatically pinpointed and tracked.

This book explains the fundamentals and operation of LBSs and gives a thorough introduction to the key
technologies and organizational procedures, offering comprehensive coverage of positioning methods,
location protocols and service platforms, alongside an overview of interfaces, languages, APIs and
middleware with examples demonstrating their usage.

Explanation and comparison of all protocols and architectures for location services●

In-depth coverage of satellite, cellular and local positioning●

All embracing introduction to 3GPP positioning methods, such as Cell-Id, E-OTD, U-TdoA, OTDoA-IPDL●

and Assisted GPS
Explains the operation of enhanced emergency services such as E-911●

Identifies unsolved research issues and challenges in the area of LBSs●

This comprehensive guide will be invaluable to undergraduate and postgraduate students and lecturers in the
area of telecommunications. It will also be a useful resource to developers and researchers seeking to expand
their knowledge in this field.
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From reader reviews:

Jordan Weatherspoon:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline Location-Based
Services: Fundamentals and Operation suitable to you? The actual book was written by famous writer in this
era. The particular book untitled Location-Based Services: Fundamentals and Operationis a single of several
books that will everyone read now. This particular book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you
read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know ahead of. The author
explained their strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this
guide. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world in this book.

Clarine Davidson:

Exactly why? Because this Location-Based Services: Fundamentals and Operation is an unordinary book that
the inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside.
Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such wonderful way makes
the content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So ,
it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal
book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your
critical thinking method. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the
reserve store hurriedly.

Richard Pascual:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Location-Based Services:
Fundamentals and Operation which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
observe.

Jonathan Rodriguez:

You can get this Location-Based Services: Fundamentals and Operation by check out the bookstore or Mall.
Simply viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the
knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by simply written or printed but also can you enjoy
this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your e-book.
It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose
correct ways for you.
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