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Textile production is an economic necessity that has confronted all societies in the past. While most textiles
were manufactured at a household level, valued textiles were traded over long distances and these trade
networks were influenced by raw material supply, labour skills, costs, as well as by regional traditions. This
was true in the Mediterranean regions and Making Textiles in pre-Roman and Roman times explores the
abundant archaeological and written evidence to understand the typological and geographical diversity of
textile commodities. Beginning in the Iron Age, the volume examines the foundations of the textile trade in
Italy and the emergence of specialist textile production in Austria, the impact of new Roman markets on
regional traditions and the role that gender played in the production of textiles. Trade networks from far
beyond the frontiers of the Empire are traced, whilst the role of specialized merchants dealing in particular
types of garment and the influence of Roman collegia on how textiles were produced and distributed are
explored. Of these collegia, that of the fullers appears to have been particularly influential at a local level and
how cloth was cleaned and treated is examined in detail, using archaeological evidence from Pompeii and
provincial contexts to understand the processes behind this area of the textile trade.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Bradford:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the publication entitled Making Textiles in pre-Roman and Roman Times: People,
Places, Identities (Ancient Textiles Series). Try to stumble through book Making Textiles in pre-Roman and
Roman Times: People, Places, Identities (Ancient Textiles Series) as your pal. It means that it can to get your
friend when you feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you personally. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know
every little thing by the book. So , let's make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Stephen Medley:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book
you have read is Making Textiles in pre-Roman and Roman Times: People, Places, Identities (Ancient
Textiles Series).

Jean Gaitan:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your
mind expertise or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more
time to be read. Making Textiles in pre-Roman and Roman Times: People, Places, Identities (Ancient
Textiles Series) can be your answer given it can be read by you actually who have those short spare time
problems.

Lawrence Abbate:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news. In this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social just like
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find the
Making Textiles in pre-Roman and Roman Times: People, Places, Identities (Ancient Textiles Series) when
you needed it?
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