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"A novel as significant as it is engrossing." —Booklist, starred review

Grant Park is a page-turning and provocative look at black and white relations in contemporary America,
blending the absurd and the poignant in a powerfully well-crafted narrative that showcases Pitts's gift for
telling emotionally wrenching stories.

Grant Park begins in 1968, with Martin Luther King's final days in Memphis. The story then moves to the
eve of the 2008 election, and cuts between the two eras. Disillusioned columnist Malcolm Toussaint, fueled
by yet another report of unarmed black men killed by police, hacks into his newspaper's server to post an
incendiary column that had been rejected by his editors. Toussaint then disappears, and his longtime editor,
Bob Carson, is summarily fired within hours of the column's publication.

While a furious Carson tries to find Toussaint—while simultaneously dealing with the reappearance of a lost
love from his days as a 60s activist—Toussaint is abducted by two white supremacists plotting to explode a
bomb at Barack Obama's planned rally in Chicago’s Grant Park. Toussaint and Carson are forced to
remember the choices they made as young men, when both their lives were changed profoundly by their
work in the civil rights movement.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Moreno:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't
like studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Grant Park.

Deborah Wilkerson:

This Grant Park are usually reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The key reason why of
this Grant Park can be one of many great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple
examining food but feed an individual with information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge.
This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions both in e-book
and printed ones. Beside that this Grant Park giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary,
giving you test of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

Linda Manning:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Grant Park, it is possible to enjoy
both. It is excellent combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can
happen its mind hangout people. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Ann Conley:

This Grant Park is new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information since it relief your
hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having tiny amount of digest in reading this Grant Park can be the light food to suit your needs because the
information inside this kind of book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books build itself in the form
that is certainly reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in guide
form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't
miss the idea! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and knowledge.
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