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J.L. Carr was the most English of Englishmen: a man who spent most of his working life in the middle of
Middle England, as headmaster of a Northamptonshire school, an enthusiastic follower of cricket and a
tireless campaigner for the conservation of country churches. But he was also the author of half a dozen of
the quirkiest, most comic novels in English, a publisher (from his own back bedroom in Kettering) of some
of the most eccentric, collectable - and smallest - books ever printed, and an enigmatic, elusive individual.
Among Carr's novels are "A Month in the Country", his moving story of a World War I survivor that is now
a Penguin Classic - which won the Guardian Fiction Award, was shortlisted for the Booker Prize and made
into a highly successful film starring Kenneth Branagh and Colin Firth; "How Steeple Sinderby Wanderers
Won the FA Cup", now published as a Prion Humour Classic and acclaimed as one of the funniest novels
ever written about football, and "The Harpole Report", acknowledged to be one of the funniest novels ever
written about a school. Meanwhile his own self-published "Carr's Dictionary of Extraordinary Cricketers"
became the smallest bestseller ever printed. This biography tells the life story of this fascinating man - a life
both surprising and varied, from war service on a West African flying-boat base to a strange interlude
teaching in the heart of South Dakota - and discovers a headmaster who would hold arithmetic races on
sports day, a mysterious individual who buried all his treasures in his garden and was someone different to
everyone who met him, and a novelist whose fiction is partially autobiographical.
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From reader reviews:

Lawanda Beverly:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr. Try to stumble through
book The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend
when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you personally. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Robert Rochester:

This The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr are generally reliable for you who want to be described as a
successful person, why. The reason of this The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr can be among the
great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple examining food but feed you with
information that maybe will shock your previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it
everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Last
Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary,
giving you test of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Clifford Walsh:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This publication The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr was filled with
regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book,
you can experience enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that
you simply wanted.

Sharon Hafer:

Many people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when they get a
half portions of the book. You can choose the book The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr to make your
own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you similar to
reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the idea about book
and studying especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and examine it. Beside that
the publication The Last Englishman: The Life of J.L Carr can to be a newly purchased friend when you're
experience alone and confuse in what must you're doing of these time.
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