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The nation is in a pivotal period. We ignore the current conditions at our peril.

Frank Islam and Ed Crego recognize this. That is why they have written this book as the sequel to their book,
Renewing the American Dream: A Citizen’s Guide for Restoring Our Competitive Advantage, that they co-
authored with George Munoz in 2010.

In this new book, Islam and Crego plot the progress—or lack thereof—that has been made since 2010 and
identify major pivot point areas that must be addressed in a positive manner to move the nation forward
rather backward.

They introduce the pivot point construct as a way for identifying, analyzing and thinking about what needs to
be done at the key pivot points which include: the debt and deficit “crisis,” congressional dysfunction, citizen
dysfunction, individual economic well being, global competition, manufacturing, immigration, education and
innovation.

Islam and Crego have structured this book to be a primer and participant’s guide for concerned citizens who
want to get involved in “working the pivot points.” Each substantive chapter ends with a section called Pivot
Point Report Card to enable the reader to engage in an organized reflection on the status of that pivot point at
the time he or she is completing the chapter.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Roybal:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
are reading whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult
problem or even exercise. Well, probably you will want this Working the Pivot Points: To Make America
Work Again: 1.

Nancy Royals:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get
a lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular
reader with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also
they write about advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try
to improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of
them is this Working the Pivot Points: To Make America Work Again: 1.

Joseph Felder:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really opposite from
that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you already been
ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Working the Pivot Points: To Make America Work
Again: 1, you can enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hangout
type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Lamar Carr:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Working the Pivot Points: To
Make America Work Again: 1 that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this
book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world considerably
better then how they react towards the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who
want to start looking at as your good habit, you may pick Working the Pivot Points: To Make America Work
Again: 1 become your own starter.
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