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Francis (FA) Mann was among the most brilliant of an exceptional group of German-Jewish émigrés who
came to Britain in the 1930s to escape persecution in Hitler's Germany. Born and educated in Germany, he
was in time to become one of Britain's most distinguished international lawyers; a scholar of English,
German and international law, a practitioner admired for his skill and tenacity, and the author of countless
books and articles on international and domestic law whose views were very much shaped by his personal
experiences and who in turn helped to shape international law in the 20th century.
Mann enjoyed a traditional German education and was set for a career in the law when Hitler came to power
in 1933. Being Jews, both Mann and his wife, Lore (also a brilliant law student) immediately left the country
of their birth for England. Francis was naturalised in 1946 and became an ardent, if not uncritical, patriot.
Having re-trained as a lawyer in England, it was not long before his rapidly expanding practice merged with
that of Herbert Smith, which was to provide the setting in which he developed into one of the most original
and enterprising legal practitioners of his day, and among the most influential legal writers of his generation.
While his reputation in the field of international law spread throughout the world, in England he was that rare
thing - a true jurist, steeped in the learning of the civil and common law, a 'cosmopolitan' lawyer long before
such a term had entered the legal lexicon.
This book is a personal recollection by someone who knew him as a friend and professional colleague for
more than 30 years. For his early life the author has drawn upon on the personal memories of family,
colleagues and friends as well as upon Mann's surviving papers, including the important and revelatory series
of letters that Mann wrote to his wife from Berlin in 1946 where he was sent as a member of the Allied
Control Commission.
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From reader reviews:

Errol Sawyer:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you will require this F.A. Mann: A Memoir.

Arthur Bailey:

This F.A. Mann: A Memoir tend to be reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why.
The reason why of this F.A. Mann: A Memoir can be one of the great books you must have will be giving
you more than just simple looking at food but feed a person with information that perhaps will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this F.A. Mann: A Memoir forcing you to have an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we know it
useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Mary May:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to
fill your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book is usually option to fill your free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to test look for
book, may be the reserve untitled F.A. Mann: A Memoir can be fine book to read. May be it is usually best
activity to you.

Elizabeth Black:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get lot of stress
from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely yes. People
is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you possess when the spare
time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading
guides. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read is usually F.A.
Mann: A Memoir.
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