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Philosophy has never delivered on its promise to settle the great moral and religious questions of human
existence, and even most philosophers conclude that it does not offer an established body of disciplinary
knowledge. Gary Gutting challenges this view by examining detailed case studies of recent achievements by
analytic philosophers such as Quine, Kripke, Gettier, Lewis, Chalmers, Plantinga, Kuhn, Rawls, and Rorty.
He shows that these philosophers have indeed produced a substantial body of disciplinary knowledge, but he
challenges many common views about what philosophers have achieved. Topics discussed include the role
of argument in philosophy, naturalist and experimentalist challenges to the status of philosophical intuitions,
the importance of pre-philosophical convictions, Rawls' method of reflective equilibrium, and Rorty's
challenge to the idea of objective philosophical truth. The book offers a lucid survey of recent analytic work
and presents a new understanding of philosophy as an important source of knowledge.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Brown:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve What Philosophers Know: Case
Studies in Recent Analytic Philosophy will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more
confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of
book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for best
book or suitable book with you?

Anthony Jarrard:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to explain
what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare
time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did you do?
Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question since just their can do that
will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on
kindergarten until university need this kind of What Philosophers Know: Case Studies in Recent Analytic
Philosophy to read.

Arthur Bailey:

Beside this What Philosophers Know: Case Studies in Recent Analytic Philosophy in your phone, it can give
you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here
is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow town. It
is good thing to have What Philosophers Know: Case Studies in Recent Analytic Philosophy because this
book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The
Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to
miss that? Find this book and also read it from today!

Anthony Wilson:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library
as well as to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library.
They go to right now there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important,
boring along with can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important
for you. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this What Philosophers Know: Case Studies in Recent Analytic



Philosophy can make you sense more interested to read.
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