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`The book is a pleasure to read and whether the model is adopted in whole or in part, as a lens through which
to examine and understand what is going on in a learning community it has much to offer' - Improving
Schools

`As a head of department in a comprehensive school in an education action zone, this book has made me
think about not only the way I relate to the students I work with but also about relationships with the teachers
in my department. I therefore warmly recommend to teachers and especially to headteachers and others in
positions of leadership in both primary and secondary phases' - Emotional & Behavioural Difficulties

`The Motivated School is an important book. It addresses a number of key issues which are central to
Scottish educational policy, including Better Behaviour: Better Learning, Inclusion and Raising Attainment.
It is also a controversial book, challenging as it does "woolly thinking" on issues such as self-esteem,
rewards and motivation to learn' - Scottish Education Review

`This book is well written and demonstrates the author's commitment and dedication to an individual's
psychological well-being and positive, effective learning environments' - The Psychology of Education
Review

`The best education books frequently challenge our assumptions. Alan McLean's The Motivated School
demonstrates with a kind of forensic exactness, the way we over-emphasize the importance of student's self-
esteem. We can't make students motivated: we can only create the right conditions. There is much to admire
in this book. It isn't difficult to read, and the format is generous and accessible. I suspect all school leaders
will learn something from it' - Geoff Barton, Times Educational Supplement, Friday Magazine



Some students do not achieve their full potential, while others of similar ability achieve more than predicted.
This book shows how important students' motivational mindsets can be in influencing the way they learn.
The author brings together evidence from recent research, shows how successful learning contexts can be
created, and provides real-life suggestions for teachers working with disengaged learners.

Increasing pressure to meet targets has sent schools down the path of trying to motivate students `from the
outside'. By recognizing that genuine motivation comes `from the inside' and that self-motivation needs to be
nurtured, this book provides a practical guide to both teacher and student motivation.

This book will be of interest to anyone seeking to develop their skills in motivating young people to learn. It
will be of particular interest to teachers, educators and management at all levels.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Ostby:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled The Motivated School. Try to make book The
Motivated School as your close friend. It means that it can being your friend when you feel alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book
makes you considerably more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we
need to make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

John Espitia:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you personally is The Motivated School this guide consist a lot of the information on the
condition of this world now. This particular book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The
language styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. This is why this book suited all of you.

Viola Boucher:

This The Motivated School is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some information given it
relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know otherwise
you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this The Motivated School can be the light food for you
because the information inside this particular book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books acquire
itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book application form. People who think
that in publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is absolutely
no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So
, don't miss that! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and knowledge.

James Weil:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the The Motivated School when you needed it?
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