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In recent years, geometry has played a lesser role in undergraduate courses than it has ever done.
Nevertheless, it still plays a leading role in mathematics at a higher level. Its central role in the history of
mathematics has never been disputed. It is important, therefore, to introduce some geometry into university
syllabuses. There are several ways of doing this, it can be incorporated into existing courses that are
primarily devoted to other topics, it can be taught at a first year level or it can be taught in higher level
courses devoted to differential geometry or to more classical topics. These notes are intended to fill a rather
obvious gap in the literature. It treats the classical topics of Euclidean, projective and hyperbolic geometry
but uses the material commonly taught to undergraduates: linear algebra, group theory, metric spaces and
complex analysis. The notes are based on a course whose aim was two fold, firstly, to introduce the students
to some geometry and secondly to deepen their understanding of topics that they have already met. What is
required from the earlier material is a familiarity with the main ideas, specific topics that are used are usually
redone.
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From reader reviews:

John Alfaro:

This Notes on Geometry (Universitext) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible
fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. That Notes on
Geometry (Universitext) without we know teach the one who looking at it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't be worry Notes on Geometry (Universitext) can bring if you are and not make your bag
space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even telephone. This
Notes on Geometry (Universitext) having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not sense
uninterested in reading.

Thomas Fleischmann:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to you is you don't know which one you should start with. This Notes on Geometry (Universitext) is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Bettye Heinrich:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this Notes on Geometry
(Universitext) book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

William Kelley:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book Notes on Geometry (Universitext) was multi-
colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Notes on Geometry (Universitext) has
many kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you
can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it
makes you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that will.
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