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The economic, social and environmental systems of the world remain in turmoil. Recent years have seen
possibly irrevocable change in the politics of Europe, Asia, Africa and Latin America.

This entirely revised and updated 11th edition describes the people, factions, and events that have shaped the
modern world from the Second World War to the present day. International issues and conflicts are placed in
their geographical contexts through the integration of over one hundred maps. The political context provided
for current events will be invaluable to all those uncertain about the changing map of Europe and Africa,
conflicts in the Middle East, and the appearances in the headlines and on our television screens by al-Qaeda,
Chechnya, the Taliban, Mercosur, Somaliland, Kosovo, AIDS, OPEC, and Schengenland. Critical new issues
are covered including the war on terrorism, nuclear proliferation, European Union expansion, and the
pressing environmental concerns faced by many sovereign states. This edition provides guidance through all
these recent changes (and many more).

This book offers up-to-date coverage of all regions in great detail. It contains an objective and concise
explanation of current events, combining maps with their geopolitical background. It provides a clear context
for events in the news, covering the Middle East, Korea, China, the European Union, east Africa, and every
other part of the world. Revised and in print since 1957, An Atlas of World Affairs continues to provide a
valuable guide for the student, teacher, journalist and all those interested in current affairs and post-war
political history.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Haight:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called An Atlas of
World Affairs? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time
with the favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have
additional opinion?

Michelle Favors:

Here thing why that An Atlas of World Affairs are different and dependable to be yours. First of all studying
a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as food or not.
An Atlas of World Affairs giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any e-book
out there but there is no book that similar with An Atlas of World Affairs. It gives you thrill reading journey,
its open up your current eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is might be can be
happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your way home by
train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of An Atlas of World
Affairs in e-book can be your option.

Rita Merritt:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This An Atlas of World Affairs book is readable by means of you who
hate those perfect word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable studying
experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer involving
An Atlas of World Affairs content conveys prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The printed
and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you
nevertheless thinking An Atlas of World Affairs is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

John Keaney:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
experience happy read one having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The An Atlas of World
Affairs is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.
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